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Andreev A.M. THE METHODICAL FEATURES OF USING LABORATORY WORK WITH 
CREATIVE ASSIGNMENTS IN THE LEARNING PROCESS IN PHYSICS / Zaporizhzhya National 
University, Ukraine. 

The problem of realization an individual approach to pupils in the process of implementation physics 
practical works is considered in the article. Shortcomings of the traditional approach to the 
implementation physics practical works are analyzed. Moreover, the experience of working with creative 
tasks that set up conditions for active inclusion in the cognitive activity students with different levels of 
educational achievements in physics is taken up. 

Key words: physical practical works, laboratory work, creative tasks, preparatory tasks, experimental and 
inventive tasks. 
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BELIKOVA I. V. THE PROBLEM OF QUALITY CONTROL OF TRAINING FUTURE TEACHERS 
OF FOREIGN LANGUAGES / Communal Institution "Kharkiv Humanitarian Pedagogical Academy" 
Kharkiv Regional Council, Ukraine. 

The article proves feasibility of solving the problem of quality control of training future teachers of 
foreign languages at the present stage of education associated with overcoming a number of 
contradictions. Modeling content and structure of teaching activities. Analysis of the concept of 
"professional competence of future teachers of foreign languages." Under the present conditions of open 
access to any information professional knowledge of the teacher are determined not only by the content of 
knowledge, but also the ability to transfer them in a way that promotes interaction, discussion, dialogue 
and argumentation. It follows that, along with knowledge of scientific facts teacher who has professional 
competence, should use interactive technologies for their processing. Analyzed the classification of types 
of control according to the level of formation of professional knowledge and skills. In order to adequately 
assess the professional knowledge and skills of future foreign language teachers the criteria that take into 
account spontaneous (the work done in class without preparation) and normative (compliance with the 
practical application of knowledge in the form of skills). Elements of these criteria in assessing the level 
of formation of professional knowledge are: spontaneous criterion line content, completeness and volume 
response, regulatory and scientific nature of knowledge, literacy narrative evidence. Determined the 
feasibility of using interactive technologies to overcome difficulties and successful execution of tasks 
objectively facing modern school in the way of reform. 

Keywords: competence, control, foreign language teachers, professional training. 


